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Message from the Guest Editor
Fruit quality is a key factor related to the consumer’s
consumption and the producer’s income, and thus
attracts a great deal of interest for both growers and
scientists. Fruit quality is determined by several factors
such as size, sweetness, flavor, peel and flesh color,
firmness, freshness, and bioactive compounds, which
are affected by genetic composition and growing
conditions. Recently, the management of fruit quality
has become very important for sustaining the fruit
industry, as climate changes as a result of global
warming are accelerating and becoming more severe
everywhere. Therefore, advanced knowledge on the
physiology and management of fruit quality is required in
order to improve the cultural performance and introduce
new cultivars under a full understanding of the
complexity of fruit quality. Therefore, this Special Issue
aims to deliver advanced scientific information by
inviting articles and reviews related to the physiology
and management of fruit quality, especially in Citrus and
Actinidia crops.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Horticultural plants and their products provide
sustenance, health, and beauty. A confluence of factors
is putting increasing pressure on horticultural
production to evolve, and innovative research is
addressing these challenges. Horticulturae provides a
venue to communicate research results in a rapid
manner with open access, allowing everyone the
opportunity to stay abreast of leading research
addressing horticulture. I invite you to consider
publishing the results of your research in this high
quality, peer-reviewed journal.
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