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Fruit quality is critical for consumer choice, which is
determined by varietal characteristics and cultivation
techniques. With the change in consumer demand, new
cultivars are being bred constantly. It is the research
hotspot and difficulties in breeding technologies
because the fruit quality is regulated by a complex
network of perennial fruits. In order to improve breeding
efficiency, the Special Issue is organized. Researches
on new fruit breeding technologies, theoretical research
of quality formation and maintenance are welcomed for
publishing. It is expected to enrich and perfect the
theoretical basis of fruit quality improvement, which may
be beneficial for breeding of different fruit species. 
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Horticultural plants and their products provide
sustenance, health, and beauty. A confluence of factors
is putting increasing pressure on horticultural
production to evolve, and innovative research is
addressing these challenges. Horticulturae provides a
venue to communicate research results in a rapid
manner with open access, allowing everyone the
opportunity to stay abreast of leading research
addressing horticulture. I invite you to consider
publishing the results of your research in this high
quality, peer-reviewed journal.
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