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The maximization of agricultural production as a primary
or value-added product is necessary for the years of
change we face. However, more than 30% of primary
production is diverted into alternative uses (value-added
products). To maximize the utilization of agricultural
products in their primary (fresh) phase, experts in
primary farm production are invited to conduct and
publish research related to value-added alternatives,
ranging from the use of wax to packaging, pre-cut and
dehydrated foods, beverages, nutrition bars, etc.; this
research can occur in collaboration with food
technologists, who understand recent lifestyle changes,
with demand for healthy, easy to handle, and sensorily
appealing food increasing. The industrialization of food
guarantees the presence of out-of-season products by
converting fresh raw material into a more stable,
available, and commercial product; it also contributes to
food security and environmental protection. Your
research could significantly impact the agro-industry.
Thus, we invite you to publish research on the
application of biotechnological or technological
processes to strengthen these sectors.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Horticultural plants and their products provide
sustenance, health, and beauty. A confluence of factors
is putting increasing pressure on horticultural
production to evolve, and innovative research is
addressing these challenges. Horticulturae provides a
venue to communicate research results in a rapid
manner with open access, allowing everyone the
opportunity to stay abreast of leading research
addressing horticulture. I invite you to consider
publishing the results of your research in this high
quality, peer-reviewed journal.
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