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Exploited for their resources and hydrothermal energy,
volcanoes regularly take away the lives and livelihoods
of neighboring communities. During Plinian eruptions,
they can influence climate and societies on regional and
global scales. Understanding volcanic geomorphology
and associated surface processes is therefore essential
from both basic and applied science perspectives. This
Issue therefore attempts to build a cornerstone,
bringing together new research in basic science as well
as the development of new tools and methods and their
application in the field of volcanic landforms and surface
processes. This Special Issue also welcomes
contributions on geomorphological knowledge applied
to disaster risk and resource management on
volcanoes. Prof. 
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Understanding the Earth’s origin and its bio-geological
evolution, the multiple implications of the geosciences
(as a coherentset of interconnected disciplines), and the
sociocultural and ethical interdisciplinary approaches,
will be crucial for a better understanding of Nature, and
also for undertaking scientificallybased political
decisions.
We are committed to drive Geosciences to a position in
which it is recognized for its high-quality, cutting-edge
research and scientific influence, and strongly
encourage and invite your participation and
manuscripts.
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