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In the context of the large body of literature now focused
on finding important sheep anf goat genes, and the
various technologies being applied to selecting whole
sheep and goat genomes for a given production system,
the role that individual genes play can be overlooked.
How then is our knowledge of individual sheep and goat
genes and their effect being used currently, or how will it
be used in the near future, to improve sheep and goat
production. Is there a large disconnect between the
science and technology and its practical applications in
sheep anf goat farming? 
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Genes is central to our understanding of biology, and
modern advances such as genomics and genome
editing have maintained genetics as a vibrant, diverse
and fast-moving field. There is a need for good quality,
open access journals in this area, and the Genes team
aims to provide expert manuscript handling, serious
peer review, and rapid publication across the whole
discipline of genetics. Starting in 2010, the journal is now
well established and recognised. Why not consider
Genes for your next genetics paper?
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