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The Internet of Things (IoT), Edge Computing, and Cloud
Computing have brought in a new era of urban
development, creating the concept of Smart Cities. This
Special Issue provides a comprehensive platform for
exploring the symbiotic relationships between these
technologies and their role in improving efficiency,
sustainability, and overall quality of life in modern urban
environments. As our cities grow into complex
ecosystems of interconnected devices, intelligent
sensors, and advanced computing infrastructures, the
potential for innovation in areas such as transportation,
healthcare, energy management, and public services
becomes clearer. This Special Issue features
contributions from top experts, researchers, and
practitioners in the field, providing a wide range of
perspectives and insights. From theoretical frameworks
to practical applications, the papers in this collection are
aimed at explaining the current state-of-the-art,
addressing emerging challenges, and propose novel
solutions that take advantage on the synergies of IoT,
Edge, and Cloud Computing in the context of Smart
Cities.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Future Internet is a fast-growing journal devoted to rapid
publications of the latest results in the general areas of
computer networking/communications and information
systems, with a focus on the Internet of Things, big data
and augmented intelligence, smart systems (in terms of
technologies, architectures, and applications), network
virtualization, edge/fog computing, and cybersecurity.
Both theoretical and experimental papers are welcome.
Every year, Future Internet also features Special Issues
dedicated to specific topics within the journal’s scope.
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