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Message from the Guest Editors

Woody biomass from short rotation woody crops (SRWCs)
plays a substantial role in feedstock production for
alternative energy sources throughout the world, thus
helping to mitigate climate change driven by excessive use
of fossil fuels. Establishment of these biomass production
systems presents the basis for more efficient development
of renewable energy sources while avoiding impacts to
essential ecosystem services (i.e., additional emissions of
carbon dioxide (CO2) into the atmosphere). In addition to
these bioenergy-related uses, the increase of degraded
land, such as industrial brownfields and municipal landfills,
has prompted the integration of biomass production with
phytotechnologies to produce income, sequester carbon,
and clean the environment. Recognizing the need for
information linking the silviculture of intensive forestry with
the provision of ecosystem services, this Special Issue
focuses on the growth and development of SRWCs grown
for all types of applications along the rural to urban
continuum (e.g., phytoremediation, green infrastructure,
energy coppice). As such, we welcome submissions related
to all aspects of producing SRWCs.

an Open Access Journal by MDPI

Growth and Development of Short Rotation Woody Crops for Rural
and Urban Applications

4.62.5

mdpi.com/si/30139 SpecialIssue

https://www.scopus.com/sourceid/21100219934
/journal/forests/stats
https://mdpi.com/si/30139
https://www.mdpi.com/si/30139
https://www.scopus.com/sourceid/21100219934
/journal/forests/stats


Editor-in-Chief

Prof. Dr. Giacomo Alessandro
Gerosa
Department of Mathematics and
Physics, Catholic University of
Brescia, I-25121 Brescia, Italy

Message from the Editor-in-Chief

Forests (ISSN 1999-4907) is an international and cross-
disciplinary, scholarly forestry journal. The distinguished
editorial board and refereeing process ensures the highest
degree of scientific rigor and review of all published
articles. Original research articles and timely reviews are
released online, with unlimited free access.

Our goal is to have  Forests be recognized as one of the
foremost publication outlets for high quality, leading edge
research in this broad and diverse field. We therefore invite
you to be one of our authors, and in doing so share your
important research findings with the global forestry
community.
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