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Message from the Guest Editors

Every year, thousands of foodborne diseases caused by
bacteria, viruses, and parasites are reported worldwide.
This fact highlights the economic and social importance of
foodborne pathogens, as they are a major public health
issue. Throughout the food chain, there are many steps
susceptible to contamination which must be properly
controlled. At present, gold standard, reference methods
are available for many of these pathogens, but these
methods tend to be lengthy, tedious, and time-consuming,
so a great effort has been made by the scientific
community to develop new techniques capable of
overcoming all these limitations. In this Special Issue, we
are seeking novel techniques, methodologies, and
applications applicable in the food industry, for the
detection and prevention of foodborne pathogens. These
may include but not be limited to DNA analysis (e.g., PCR/
qPCR, isothermal DNA amplification techniques, next-
generation sequencing), proteomics, (bio)sensors, and
novel sample treatment procedures, among others.
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Editor-in-Chief

Prof. Dr. Arun K. Bhunia
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Department of Comparative
Pathobiology (Courtesy), Purdue
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

Foods (ISSN 2304-8158) is an open access and peer
reviewed scientific journal that publishes original articles,
critical reviews, case reports, and short communications on
food science. Articles are released monthly online, with
unlimited free access. Currently, Foods has been indexed
by the Science Citation Index Expanded (SCIE - Web of
Science), PubMed, and Scopus. Our aim is to encourage
scientists, researchers, and other food professionals to
publish their experimental and theoretical results as much
detail as possible. We therefore invite you to be one of our
authors, and in doing so share your important research
findings with the global food science community.
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