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The diminishing supply of conventional energy reserves
and the growing environmental concerns have made
renewable energy an attractive source for the future.
Thus this Special Issue would also address the current
and future issues of Renewable Energy in agricultural
sectors. We wish to invite researchers in the area of
Renewable Energy for Agriculture to submit their
contribution to our Special Issue of Renewable Energy
for Agricultural sectors. We are interested in articles
related to renewable energy resources (solar, wind,
biomass, hydraulic, algae, water, hydrogen), bioenergy
from agriculture, biomass production and energy
recovery in agriculture. Energy is the main input of the
agricultural industry and technology. 
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Energies is an international, open access journal in
energy engineering and research. The journal publishes
original papers, review articles, technical notes, and
letters. Authors are encouraged to submit manuscripts
which bridge the gaps between research, development
and implementation. The journal provides a forum for
information on research, innovation, and demonstration
in the areas of energy conversion and conservation, the
optimal use of energy resources, optimization of energy
processes, mitigation of environmental pollutants, and
sustainable energy systems.
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