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Biosystems Engineering (BSE) aims to become the
leading annual conference in the Baltic region in fields
related to traditional and modern engineering
techniques and technical solutions applied to biological
systems. The goal of BSE 2019 is to gather scholars
from all over the world to present advances in the fields
of biosystems engineering and to foster an environment
conducive to exchanging ideas and information. This
conference will also provide an ideal environment to
develop new collaborations and meet experts on the
fundamentals, applications, and products of the
mentioned fields. Among the more prominent topics of
the conference are energy and fuels from renewable
sources, bioenergy, waste-to-energy, etc.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Energies is an international, open access journal in
energy engineering and research. The journal publishes
original papers, review articles, technical notes, and
letters. Authors are encouraged to submit manuscripts
which bridge the gaps between research, development
and implementation. The journal provides a forum for
information on research, innovation, and demonstration
in the areas of energy conversion and conservation, the
optimal use of energy resources, optimization of energy
processes, mitigation of environmental pollutants, and
sustainable energy systems.
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