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We are inviting submissions to a Special Issue of
Energies on the subject of “Advances in Energy
Efficiency and Control Systems”. The growing demand
for sustainable energy solutions has placed a spotlight
on the importance of enhancing energy efficiency and
control systems, particularly in the context of solar
energy technologies. This Special Issue seeks to
explore the latest developments and innovative
practices surrounding solar energy, energy efficiency,
and the integration of advanced control mechanisms to
optimize performance. Looking ahead, the intersection
of solar energy, energy efficiency, and control systems
presents a promising landscape for research and
development. We invite contributors from diverse
backgrounds to share their findings and perspectives,
fostering dialog that drives advancements in this vital
field. Through collaborative efforts, we anticipate that
this Special Issue will serve as a catalyst for innovation,
ultimately contributing to a more sustainable and
energy-efficient future. This Special Issue will deal with
novel design, optimization, and control techniques for
energy efficiency and control systems.
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Energies is an international, open access journal in
energy engineering and research. The journal publishes
original papers, review articles, technical notes, and
letters. Authors are encouraged to submit manuscripts
which bridge the gaps between research, development
and implementation. The journal provides a forum for
information on research, innovation, and demonstration
in the areas of energy conversion and conservation, the
optimal use of energy resources, optimization of energy
processes, mitigation of environmental pollutants, and
sustainable energy systems.
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