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Affected by economic development and population
expansion, the world's coal consumption is increasing,
leading to increasingly prominent energy problems at
this stage and the unreasonable exploitation of fossil
energy has caused serious environmental impacts,
which has caused the world to continue to pay attention
to energy and environmental issues. Therefore, it is
necessary to optimize the existing mining technology
from all aspects of coal mining technology, thus,
minimizing the pollution to the environment. Potential
topics include, but are not limited to, the following: deep
coal mining technology; smart mining technology;
underground unmanned mining technology; backfilling
mining technology.
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Energies is an international, open access journal in
energy engineering and research. The journal publishes
original papers, review articles, technical notes, and
letters. Authors are encouraged to submit manuscripts
which bridge the gaps between research, development
and implementation. The journal provides a forum for
information on research, innovation, and demonstration
in the areas of energy conversion and conservation, the
optimal use of energy resources, optimization of energy
processes, mitigation of environmental pollutants, and
sustainable energy systems.
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