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Message from the Guest Editors
Dear colleagues, Agricultural robotics has advanced
significantly in recent years and is the core on which
Agriculture 5.0 is based, together with artificial
intelligence (AI). Its introduction in the field is slower than
in the industrial sector, but it is necessary in order to
meet current and future challenges such as labour
shortages, increased production, efficiency in the
application of the resources employed, or the improved
safety and quality of work. Numerous research projects
currently aim to employ robotics in the field to carry out
certain tasks such as pruning, the application of
phytosanitary products, sowing, harvesting and logistics
or simply crop monitoring, as well as employ general-
purpose robots that enable various tasks to be carried
out via the incorporation of various implements. In this
Special Issue, our aim is to collect works related to the
application of robotics in the agricultural field. It will
address topics such as autonomous machinery, artificial
intelligence applied to the performance of tasks, sensor
technologies for the improvement of processes,
intelligent work methodologies and cloud computing.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Electronics is a multidisciplinary journal designed to
appeal to a diverse audience of research scientists,
practitioners, and developers in academia and industry.
The journal is devoted to fast publication of latest
technological breakthroughs, cutting-edge
developments, and timely reviews of current and
emerging technologies related to the broad field of
electronics. Experimental and theoretical results are
published as regular peer-reviewed articles or as
articles within Special Issues guest-edited by leading
experts in selected topics of interest.
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Author Benefits

High Visibility:
indexed within Scopus, SCIE (Web of Science), CAPlus /
SciFinder, Inspec, Ei Compendex and other databases.

Journal Rank:
JCR - Q2 (Engineering, Electrical and Electronic) /
CiteScore - Q1 (Electrical and Electronic Engineering)

Rapid Publication:
manuscripts are peer-reviewed and a first decision is
provided to authors approximately 16.8 days after
submission; acceptance to publication is undertaken in 2.4
days (median values for papers published in this journal in
the first half of 2025).
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