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This Special Issue, titled "Occupational Health
Challenges: Mapping Psychosocial Factors Driving
Healthy Organizations", aims to deepen our
understanding of contemporary challenges by providing
a platform for the comprehension, analysis, and
dissemination of research findings in the organizational
field. Although it has been demonstrated that well-being
within organizations leads to benefits for workers'
physical and mental health, as well as for performance
and productivity, many questions remain unanswered.
Topics covered in this Special Issue include workplace
stress, work–family balance, participation in decision-
making within the organization, organizational justice,
burnout, engagement, interpersonal and group
relationships at work, diversity, telework and mental
health, among others. We invite researchers,
academics, and professionals in related fields to submit
their original research, systematic reviews, and meta-
analyses that offer new perspectives and solutions to
the psychosocial challenges in the workplace.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editorial Board
The journal offers an integrating approach to the
disciplines it addresses, highlighting the role of health
as a transversal axis in educational and psychological
processes, present in human development, throughout
the life cycle. European Journal of Investigation in
Health, Psychology and Education (ISSN 2254-9625) is a
peer-reviewed scientific journal that publishes original
articles and systematic reviews or meta-analyses
related to research on human development throughout
the life cycle. It is a journal of the University Association
of Education and Psychology and is published
monthly online by MDPI.
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