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Near-space is a new type of strategic space, offering
significant advantages for diverse applications such as
surveillance, communication, and scientific research. As
an ideal platform for exploring and exploiting this space,
technologies like stratospheric airships, high-altitude
solar drones, and high-altitude balloons are rapidly
advancing. With the maturation of high-altitude platform
technology, the demand for practicality is increasing,
and related industries are gradually emerging with huge
market space. This Special Issue aims to publish
cutting-edge research results on the design and flight
control of near-space low-speed aircraft, a rapidly
evolving and highly significant area within the broader
field of drone technology. It will contribute to the
development of innovative UAV technologies and their
successful application within the emerging near-space
domain.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Drones is the only international open-access journal
about the science, policy and technology of drones and
its applications. Nowadays, the proliferation of drones is
a reality for local policy makers, regulatory bodies,
mapping authorities, startups and consolidated
companies. There are many uses and benefits of
drones: from the emergence of new sensors and the
evolution of new platforms; to the development of
specific software and the emergence of new
applications. Drones publishes reviews, regular
research papers, communications and short notes,
without restriction on the length of papers. Drones
seeks to provide a central forum for scholars engaged in
drones’ research and applications.
There is a need for high quality papers in this area and
the Drones Editorial Board are widely recognized
international leaders. Drones journal guarantees a
serious peer review and a rapid publication across the
whole discipline of drones.
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