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Tens of thousands of wildlife species are increasingly
confronted with habitat degradation and threatened with
local extirpation and global extinction as a result of
human activities. As anthropogenic activities expand in
natural areas, wildlife habitats face growing
fragmentation, degradation, and loss, which negatively
affect species diversity and distribution. In the
Anthropocene, understanding the impacts of
anthropogenic influence on diversity and distribution of
wildlife communities is increasingly relevant to effective
conservation. This Special Issue will focus on human
impacts on diversity and distribution of wildlife species
with implications for wildlife conservation. More details
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Diversity (ISSN 1424-2818) is a scholarly journal that
covers all areas of diversity research. Our distinguished
editorial board and refereeing process ensures the
highest degree of scientific rigor for publishing. Original
research articles and timely reviews are released online,
with unlimited free access.
We invite papers and reviews on multidisciplinary topics
of diversity that bridge organismic diversity (systematics,
biodiversity, phylogeny, population genetics, and
evolution) and molecular diversity (phytochemistry and
biophysics).

Editor-in-Chief

Prof. Dr. Michael Wink
Institute of Pharmacy and Molecular Biotechnology, Heidelberg
University, Im Neuenheimer Feld 329, D-69120 Heidelberg, Germany

Author Benefits

High Visibility:
indexed within Scopus, SCIE (Web of Science), PubAg,
GEOBASE, CAPlus / SciFinder, and other databases.

Journal Rank:
JCR - Q2 (Biodiversity Conservation) / CiteScore - Q1
(Agricultural and Biological Sciences (miscellaneous))

Rapid Publication:
manuscripts are peer-reviewed and a first decision is
provided to authors approximately 17.1 days after
submission; acceptance to publication is undertaken in 2.9
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