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Breast cancer is the most commonly diagnosed
malignant tumor and one of the leading causes of
cancer-related mortality among women. Recent
advances in diagnostics and treatment have enabled
earlier detection, resulting in improved survival rates.
Personalized care, encompassing diagnostic strategies,
surgical interventions, systemic treatments, and
radiation therapy, is grounded in evidence-based
practice and a nuanced understanding of tumor biology.
Ongoing efforts are focused on detecting breast cancer
at its earliest stages through minimally invasive or non-
invasive methods that are also cost-effective. A growing
body of research examines both tumor-specific features
and individual patient factors that may contribute to the
development of malignant breast lesions. Significant
strides have been made in diagnosing both
premalignant and malignant breast conditions.
Innovations in imaging such as 3D mammography,
surpassing traditional 2D methods, along with improved
patient selection and optimized screening protocols
have enhanced early detection. Our understanding of
what makes screening effective continues to evolve.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
You are cordially invited to submit research articles,
short communications, comprehensive reviews, case
reports or interesting images for consideration and
publication in Diagnostics (ISSN 2075-4418).
Diagnostics is published in open access format –
research articles, reviews and other contents are
released on the Internet immediately after acceptance.
The scientific community and the general public have
unlimited and free access to the content as soon as it is
published. We would be pleased to welcome you as one
of our authors.
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