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Novel diagnostic biomarkers, emerging from structural,
functional neuro-imaging and magnetic-resonance
spectroscopy, will be compared in terms of their
prediction value with other diagnostic tests, such as
genetic, immune-biological, and psychomotor
measures. In this Special Issue, we will address the
incremental validity of those methods in the context of
complex multimodal and machine learning modelling of
the signatures of mental disorder, and we will be
particularly focused on the relevance of those
biomarkers for early detection of psychosis, direction of
new treatment strategies, and monitoring of their effect.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
You are cordially invited to submit research articles,
short communications, comprehensive reviews, case
reports or interesting images for consideration and
publication in Diagnostics (ISSN 2075-4418).
Diagnostics is published in open access format –
research articles, reviews and other contents are
released on the Internet immediately after acceptance.
The scientific community and the general public have
unlimited and free access to the content as soon as it is
published. We would be pleased to welcome you as one
of our authors.
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