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Gastrointestinal and hepato-bilio-pancreatic disorders,
including benign and malignant oncological diseases,
acute and chronic intestinal ailments, and exotoxin-
related syndromes, can present a relevant diagnostic
challenge. Issues in radiological diagnosis stem from
complex anatomy of the abdominal region and difficult
differential diagnosis among diseases at different
prognoses and treatments but with a similar
presentation at standard imaging modalities. Significant
progress in imaging methods, such as imaging fusion,
advanced segmentation, texture analysis, and artificial
intelligence, have been recently reported and are the
object of major research to extract as much information
as possible from the available imaging data. In this
issue, we aim to gather the latest available evidence on
any advanced and innovative imaging approach, aiming
at diagnosis, staging or treatment guidance of
gastrointestinal and hepato-bilio-pancreatic disorders.
Manuscripts describing any types of imaging, i.e., US,
CT, MRI, scintigraphy or PET can be submitted to this
Special Issue.  
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
You are cordially invited to submit research articles,
short communications, comprehensive reviews, case
reports or interesting images for consideration and
publication in Diagnostics (ISSN 2075-4418).
Diagnostics is published in open access format –
research articles, reviews and other contents are
released on the Internet immediately after acceptance.
The scientific community and the general public have
unlimited and free access to the content as soon as it is
published. We would be pleased to welcome you as one
of our authors.
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