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and innovations in cytological diagnosis. It covers varied
topics, including enhanced sensitivity in fine-needle
aspiration cytology, rapid onsite evaluation (ROSE) and
telecytology, and advancements in ancillary testing with
FISH and non-FISH molecular markers. It will also
highlight the importance of these advancements for
improving diagnostic accuracy and patient care.
Additionally, it discusses the challenges faced in
distinguishing between benign and malignant
proliferations, especially in limited tissue and cytologic
samples, and explores the role of
immunohistochemistry and fluorescence in situ
hybridization in ancillary studies. 
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About the Journal
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You are cordially invited to submit research articles,
short communications, comprehensive reviews, case
reports or interesting images for consideration and
publication in Diagnostics (ISSN 2075-4418).
Diagnostics is published in open access format –
research articles, reviews and other contents are
released on the Internet immediately after acceptance.
The scientific community and the general public have
unlimited and free access to the content as soon as it is
published. We would be pleased to welcome you as one
of our authors.
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