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Message from the Guest Editors

The emerging market of wearables is growing due to the
presence of the state-of-the-art devices in our lives.
Wristbands that track our sport activity, smartwatches with
localization capabilities, and eHealth devices that monitor
our vital constants are becoming more common in the 21st
century life. The ecosystem of interconnected wearables is
a source of crowdsourced information that enables
advanced big data analysis and the application of deep
learning models.

This Special Issue is devoted but not limited to data sets
including any raw data collected by wearable devices and
smartphones, as well as processing of such kind of data for
wireless communications, tracking, indoor and outdoor
positioning, eHealth monitoring, sport analysis, and
gesture recognition, among others.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

Data is an open access journal that publishes scientific
data in a reliable, citable, and accountable manner. Data
grants the opportunity to formally share valuable data, for
academic credit. It covers a wide range of disciplines in
which data is generated so that published data is
discoverable and available for wider re-use. The journal has
highly accomplished scientists from a variety of disciplines
on the editorial board. The publication emphasizes clarity,
honesty, quality, and novelty and has a rigorous peer-
review process. We strongly encourage you to share your
data vision in Data.
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