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Message from the Guest Editors

Dear Colleagues,

For the longest time, the management of gynecologic
malignancies was very streamlined, with few options and
mediocre outcomes, especially for those with advanced or
recurrent disease. In the recent past, however, there has
been a rapid advancement in care, including methods of
surgical access to the malignancy, molecular diagnosis,
and classification of disease, personal medicine
therapeutic options and methods of radiation therapy, and
combinations thereof. We invite researchers to address one
of these topics related to malignancies of the
ovary/fallopian tube, uterus, cervix/vagina/vulvar (lower
genital tract), or gestational trophoblastic neoplasm.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

I am honored and enthusiastic to serve as incoming Editor-
in-Chief of Current Oncology. Since its establishment in
1994, Current Oncology has been playing an important role
in the advancement of cancer care by disseminating new
knowledge in the cancer care continuum. Current
Oncology is affiliated with several key cancer societies and
provides a global platform to share scientific progress in
oncology. We strive for high standards and work together
to maintain a rigorous and unbiased peer review process
to publish high-quality articles. We have an outstanding
editorial team which is committed to the success of Current
Oncology.
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