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This Special Issue involves studies on treating babies,
children, and teenagers with a wide range of complex
medical dental conditions. Pediatric dentistry is
dedicated to the oral health of children from infancy
through their teen years. Orthodontic irregularities may
be present at birth or develop during toddlerhood or
early childhood. Crooked teeth hamper self-esteem and
make good oral homecare difficult, whereas straight
teeth help minimize the risk of tooth decay and
childhood periodontal disease. Children is publishing
this Special Issue to create a collection of papers on
pediatric dentistry and juvenile orthodontics. The aim is
to build a community of authors and readers to discuss
the latest research and develop new ideas and research
directions in this particular field. Papers published in the
Special Issue will be collected together on a dedicated
page of the journal website.
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You are invited to contribute a research article or
comprehensive review for consideration and publication
in Children (ISSN 2227-9067). Children is an open
access journal—research articles, reviews, and other
content are published online immediately after
acceptance. The scientific community and the general
public have unlimited free access to the content as soon
as it is published. The journal focuses on sharing clinical,
epidemiological, and translational science relevant to
children’s health. We would be pleased to welcome you
as one of our authors.
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