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The enhancement of the clinical management of
growing patients has always been a great challenge for
orthodontists and pediatric dentists. In this regard,
pediatric orthodontics and dentistry aim to provide
complete preventative and therapeutic care for kids and
teens. Most of the new available technologies and
equipment aim to improve patients’ experience. New
diagnostic and therapeutic tools are available to
enhance the diagnosis and treatment plan strategies in
orthodontic growing subjects. This care includes
diagnosis, treatment, and consulting expertise for
newborns, kids, and teenagers of all ages, including
those with special care needs. We invite authors to
submit original research articles (trials, cohort studies or
case–control or cross-sectional studies), literature
reviews (narrative or systematic reviews or meta-
analyses), as well as high-quality case reports
highlighting the above-mentioned topics. 
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You are invited to contribute a research article or
comprehensive review for consideration and publication
in Children (ISSN 2227-9067). Children is an open
access journal—research articles, reviews, and other
content are published online immediately after
acceptance. The scientific community and the general
public have unlimited free access to the content as soon
as it is published. The journal focuses on sharing clinical,
epidemiological, and translational science relevant to
children’s health. We would be pleased to welcome you
as one of our authors.
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