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In recent years, there have been remarkable advances
in the knowledge of pediatric esophagus disease,
demonstrating the enthusiasm that researchers all over
the world have for this field of medicine. The strategy of
surgical treatment is constantly changing and has been
the subject of academic discussion. Minimally invasive
approaches, interdisciplinary treatment strategies,
robotics, endoscopic surgery, and new technologies are
of great interest. The goal of this Special Issue is for
academics to discuss any of these mentioned topics
and to share their experiences related to this field.
Surgeons and researchers are encouraged to contribute
their most innovative manuscripts. A variety of
contributions to this Special Issue are welcome: papers,
review articles, systemic reviews, proposals for new
strategic approaches, and prospective/retrospective
case studies. I look forward to receiving your
contributions.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
You are invited to contribute a research article or
comprehensive review for consideration and publication
in Children (ISSN 2227-9067). Children is an open
access journal—research articles, reviews, and other
content are published online immediately after
acceptance. The scientific community and the general
public have unlimited free access to the content as soon
as it is published. The journal focuses on sharing clinical,
epidemiological, and translational science relevant to
children’s health. We would be pleased to welcome you
as one of our authors.
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