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We are delighted to invite all researchers, clinicians, and
experts in the field of pediatric diabetes to contribute to
our upcoming Special Issue, titled "Glycemic Control in
Children and Adolescents with Type 1 Diabetes." This
Special Issue aims to provide a comprehensive platform
for the exchange of knowledge and insights in this
critical area of healthcare. Type 1 diabetes presents
unique challenges in pediatric populations, and effective
glycemic control is paramount for the health and
wellbeing of young people. We invite original research,
clinical studies, reviews, and perspectives that address
several aspects of glucose control among children and
adolescents with type 1 diabetes, including innovative
treatments, technological advancements, data on acute
and chronic complications, psychosocial support, and
patient education.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
You are invited to contribute a research article or
comprehensive review for consideration and publication
in Children (ISSN 2227-9067). Children is an open
access journal—research articles, reviews, and other
content are published online immediately after
acceptance. The scientific community and the general
public have unlimited free access to the content as soon
as it is published. The journal focuses on sharing clinical,
epidemiological, and translational science relevant to
children’s health. We would be pleased to welcome you
as one of our authors.
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