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Childhood immune diseases comprise a wide range of
conditions, including inborn errors of immunity, and
allergic, immune dysregulation, autoinflammatory,
autoimmune and lymphoproliferative disorders as well
as organ-specific immunopathology. Attempts are being
made to identify the prognosis, patterns, severity scale
of outcomes, and the global social and psychological
burden of inborn errors of immunity and allergic
diseases among pediatric patients. Significant progress
has been made recently in uncovering the genetic,
molecular, immunological and environmental
underpinnings of childhood immune and allergic
diseases. The aim of this Special Issue is to better
understand the immunogenetic background and clinico-
pathological interconnections of childhood immune and
allergic diseases. The thematic scope of articles will
encompass the clinical, diagnostic and therapeutic
aspects of these disorders. In this Special Issue, original
research articles and reviews are particularly welcome.
Instructive case reports on unusual immune and allergic
conditions in children are also accepted.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
You are invited to contribute a research article or
comprehensive review for consideration and publication
in Children (ISSN 2227-9067). Children is an open
access journal—research articles, reviews, and other
content are published online immediately after
acceptance. The scientific community and the general
public have unlimited free access to the content as soon
as it is published. The journal focuses on sharing clinical,
epidemiological, and translational science relevant to
children’s health. We would be pleased to welcome you
as one of our authors.
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