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Pediatric dentistry has a significant impact on a child's
future in a variety of educational and professional
settings. Early intervention in managing children's dental
health not only improves the diagnosis and treatment
planning process but also leads to better planning and
increased confidence in diagnostic procedures. Three-
dimensional imaging proves valuable across the
spectrum of dentistry, pediatric included, by facilitating
the capture of precise images and enhancing the
accuracy of diagnoses. The aim of this Special Issue is
to bring together cutting-edge dental resources,
integrating contemporary insights from clinical pediatric
dentistry for the purpose of diagnosis and treatment
planning. We hope that it will serve as a guiding
framework for future innovative research in the field.
This Special Issue is open to submissions from
professionals, researchers, and dental practitioners. We
gladly extend an invitation to you to be part of our team,
and we look forward to receiving your valuable
contribution!
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
You are invited to contribute a research article or
comprehensive review for consideration and publication
in Children (ISSN 2227-9067). Children is an open
access journal—research articles, reviews, and other
content are published online immediately after
acceptance. The scientific community and the general
public have unlimited free access to the content as soon
as it is published. The journal focuses on sharing clinical,
epidemiological, and translational science relevant to
children’s health. We would be pleased to welcome you
as one of our authors.
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