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Dear colleagues, Human milk is the optimal form of
nutrition for all infants, with significant short- and long-
term benefits for both the mother and infant. Although
there has been a modest increase in breastfeeding
rates over the past few years, we remain short of our
target goals, as described by the WHO and Healthy
People 2020 goals. Breastfeeding rates have also not
increased uniformly in all communities due to
socioeconomic and cultural differences. This Special
Issue is dedicated to studies regarding the impact of
human milk and breastfeeding in achieving desirable
health outcomes in our population of infants and their
mothers. Research demonstrating the effects of human
milk feeding on both short- and long-term mother–infant
outcomes will contribute to the general knowledge base
related to this topic and promote one of the major public
health initiatives of our time.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
You are invited to contribute a research article or
comprehensive review for consideration and publication
in Children (ISSN 2227-9067). Children is an open
access journal—research articles, reviews, and other
content are published online immediately after
acceptance. The scientific community and the general
public have unlimited free access to the content as soon
as it is published. The journal focuses on sharing clinical,
epidemiological, and translational science relevant to
children’s health. We would be pleased to welcome you
as one of our authors.
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