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Malocclusion is a prevalent condition in children that
can impact oral health, facial appearance, and
psychological behavior. Timely prevention and
orthodontic care are essential in managing this issue, as
they can help prevent more serious dental problems
later on. When malocclusion is identified, orthodontic
treatment, such as functional appliances, braces, or
clear aligners, is often recommended. Early treatment
can lead to better results by enhancing both the function
and visual alignment of the teeth and jaws. By
addressing malocclusion in its early stages, children can
reduce the risk of problems like difficulty chewing and
speaking and increased susceptibility to tooth decay
and gum disease, contributing to improved long-term
dental health. We invite original articles, systematic
reviews, scoping reviews, and observational cohort
studies to contribute to this Special Issue. We are
looking forward to receiving your valuable submissions
which will advance our knowledge in this field. 
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
You are invited to contribute a research article or
comprehensive review for consideration and publication
in Children (ISSN 2227-9067). Children is an open
access journal—research articles, reviews, and other
content are published online immediately after
acceptance. The scientific community and the general
public have unlimited free access to the content as soon
as it is published. The journal focuses on sharing clinical,
epidemiological, and translational science relevant to
children’s health. We would be pleased to welcome you
as one of our authors.
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