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We are delighted to introduce this Special Issue of
Cancers on the role of genes in prostate cancer.
Prostate cancer is the fifth leading cause of cancer
death in men worldwide, with an estimated 1.4 million
cases of prostate cancer diagnosed, and an estimated
375,000 men have died from prostate cancer. Prostate
cancer is a clinical and molecular heterogeneous
disease with disparities in incidence and mortality. This
Special Issue will highlight new genetic and genomic
insights into prostate cancers, which have provided a
better comprehensive landscape of the germline
variations or somatic molecular profiles involved in
prostate cancer carcinogenesis or in the progression to
metastatic and lethal disease. 
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Cancers is an international online journal addressing
both clinical and basic science issues related to cancer
research. The journal is publishing in Open Access
format, which will certainly evolve to ensure that the
journal takes full advantage of the rapidly changing
world of information and knowledge dissemination. It
publishes high-quality clinical, translational, and basic
science research on cancer prevention, initiation,
progression, and treatment, as well as other related
topics, particularly to capture the most seminal studies
in the rapidly growing area of immunology,
immunotherapy, and tumor microenvironment.
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