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Neuroblastoma, a childhood embryonal tumor arising
from sympathoadrenal precursors, remains a significant
clinical challenge. Patients with high-risk disease are
treated with toxic combinations of chemotherapy,
radiation therapy, and anti-GD2 immunotherapy, and yet
5-year progression free survival for these patients
remains less than 65%, and survivors are left with
significant morbidities. Preclinical studies have
identified the role of additional oncogenic pathways in
disease resistance, including immortalization through
telomere maintenance mechanisms, alternative
metabolomics, and the activation of orthogonal
oncogenic pathways, among others. Novel approaches
are needed to attack these critical nodes of
neuroblastoma viability, both through the development
of new therapeutics and through the repurposing of
available agents. Innovative study designs will be
necessary, making use of integrative diagnostics and
theranostics to personalize therapy, and using
combination therapies for synergistic efficacy and
reduced toxicity. We invite submissions on basic
laboratory, preclinical, and clinical research highlighting
these paths to improved outcomes for children with
neuroblastoma.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Cancers is an international online journal addressing
both clinical and basic science issues related to cancer
research. The journal is publishing in Open Access
format, which will certainly evolve to ensure that the
journal takes full advantage of the rapidly changing
world of information and knowledge dissemination. It
publishes high-quality clinical, translational, and basic
science research on cancer prevention, initiation,
progression, and treatment, as well as other related
topics, particularly to capture the most seminal studies
in the rapidly growing area of immunology,
immunotherapy, and tumor microenvironment.
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