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Testicular Cancer (TC) is the most commonly diagnosed
malignant tumor in males between the ages of 16 and
40 years. The incidence of TC continues to rise, and the
vast majority of TC patients are diagnosed with clinical
stage I disease, either non-seminoma or seminoma
testis. The aim of this Special Issue of Cancers is to
address the following important clinical knowledge gaps
regarding the diagnosis and management of clinical
stage I TC: i) the impact of TC diagnosis on
psychological and sexual wellbeing and fertility of
patients; ii) the need for new and improved detection of
prognostic markers to more accurately identify patients
at the highest risk of relapse following orchiectomy; iii)
controversies surrounding risk-adapted management of
adjuvant treatment; and iv) the importance of long-term
TC survivorship and monitoring of late side-effects. I
sincerely hope this issue of Cancers will be read with
great interest by clinicians, researchers, and patients.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Cancers is an international online journal addressing
both clinical and basic science issues related to cancer
research. The journal is publishing in Open Access
format, which will certainly evolve to ensure that the
journal takes full advantage of the rapidly changing
world of information and knowledge dissemination. It
publishes high-quality clinical, translational, and basic
science research on cancer prevention, initiation,
progression, and treatment, as well as other related
topics, particularly to capture the most seminal studies
in the rapidly growing area of immunology,
immunotherapy, and tumor microenvironment.
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