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Breast conservation therapy has been established as
one of the mainstays of breast cancer treatment. It is
accepted that it offers overall survival equivalent to
mastectomy, and some studies have even suggested
that it may offer superior survival. There are global
variations in the utilization and implementation of breast
conservation therapy. However, healthcare systems,
access to radiation and plastic surgery, and the cultural
zeitgeist can affect its use. This Special Issue offers
international global perspectives spanning several
continents, including North America, Asia, Africa, and
Europe, on the unique characteristics of BCT in different
parts of the world. I look forward to receiving your
contributions. 
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Cancers is an international online journal addressing
both clinical and basic science issues related to cancer
research. The journal is publishing in Open Access
format, which will certainly evolve to ensure that the
journal takes full advantage of the rapidly changing
world of information and knowledge dissemination. It
publishes high-quality clinical, translational, and basic
science research on cancer prevention, initiation,
progression, and treatment, as well as other related
topics, particularly to capture the most seminal studies
in the rapidly growing area of immunology,
immunotherapy, and tumor microenvironment.
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