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In this Special Issue dedicated to the screening and
diagnostics of prostate cancer various controversies,
several studies are presented which illustrate the
ongoing improvement and discussion in the field
worldwide. The technical progress in imaging with MRI,
and PSMA-PET scanning, as well as the new serum and
urinary assays, add a number of elements to the
process of screening and diagnostic procedures.
Multifactorial risk evaluation appears to be basic to
make decisions by patients and their physicians. Profs
Chris Bangma and Axel Semjonow highlight this
dynamic evaluation of thoughts between specialists on
early prostate cancer. 
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Cancers is an international online journal addressing
both clinical and basic science issues related to cancer
research. The journal is publishing in Open Access
format, which will certainly evolve to ensure that the
journal takes full advantage of the rapidly changing
world of information and knowledge dissemination. It
publishes high-quality clinical, translational, and basic
science research on cancer prevention, initiation,
progression, and treatment, as well as other related
topics, particularly to capture the most seminal studies
in the rapidly growing area of immunology,
immunotherapy, and tumor microenvironment.
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