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Tumors of the eye are classified as orbital or intraocular
neoplasia. Orbital diseases include lymphoma and
metastasis. Primary orbital tumors are rare, such as
cconjunctival melanoma, and are often difficult to treat,
with high rates of recurrence and metastasis. Choroidal
melanoma has the highest prevalence of all primary
intraocular tumors. Primary disease control and eye
preservation are achieved in most patients, because
effective and complementary treatment strategies,
ascertaining to local tumor control, exist. Classically,
brachytherapy with iodine or ruthenium plaques, proton
therapy, or radiosurgery with photons are commonly
being employed. Metastatic spread, however, has
remained challenging and therapeutic options remain
limited, although important progress has been made
with immunotherapies in recent years. The current
Special Issue of Cancers is set to highlight novel
developments in translational medicine, organ-
preserving therapies for intraocular tumors, and
innovative strategies regarding how to most
appropriately deal with metastatic disease.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Cancers is an international online journal addressing
both clinical and basic science issues related to cancer
research. The journal is publishing in Open Access
format, which will certainly evolve to ensure that the
journal takes full advantage of the rapidly changing
world of information and knowledge dissemination. It
publishes high-quality clinical, translational, and basic
science research on cancer prevention, initiation,
progression, and treatment, as well as other related
topics, particularly to capture the most seminal studies
in the rapidly growing area of immunology,
immunotherapy, and tumor microenvironment.
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