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CAR T-cell therapy has achieved unprecedented clinical
responses against certain advanced and treatment
refractory B lymphocyte malignancies, leading to first
regulatory approval of CD19-directed CAR-T cells in
2018. Non-hematological solid tumors, however, have
proven less responsive to CAR T-cells, and cross-
reactivity against healthy tissues is an important safety
issue. Limited homing, along with barriers imposed by
the stroma, can restrict the number of CAR-T cells
reaching the solid tumor bed. Moreover, a range of
obstacles, including limited oxygen and nutrients, as
well as the presence of suppressive immune infiltrate,
can lead to CAR-T cell anergy or exhaustion. This
Special Issue aims to provide the current status of CAR
T cells in the treatment of solid tumors, as well cutting-
edge cell culture, CAR-design, gene-engineering, and
combinatorial approaches for overcoming challenges in
the field. 
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Cancers is an international online journal addressing
both clinical and basic science issues related to cancer
research. The journal is publishing in Open Access
format, which will certainly evolve to ensure that the
journal takes full advantage of the rapidly changing
world of information and knowledge dissemination. It
publishes high-quality clinical, translational, and basic
science research on cancer prevention, initiation,
progression, and treatment, as well as other related
topics, particularly to capture the most seminal studies
in the rapidly growing area of immunology,
immunotherapy, and tumor microenvironment.
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