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Cancer is a disease that presents during aging. By
2030, more that 70% of adults with cancer will be over
the age of 65. Many older adults can have complex
healthcare needs at time of diagnosis, including
comorbid conditions and pre-existing physical or
cognitive impairments, a decreased functional ability
and an increased risk of falling. This puts older adults at
a disadvantage as they prepare to recover from cancer
treatment. Yet, aging is a heterogenous process, and in
some cases, older adults are quite robust, but due to
their age and potential ageism, they do not receive
proper treatment. Gaps in understanding the treatment
outcomes of older adults with cancer and the impact of
supportive services to address the needs of this
population remain. This Special Issue will highlight
outcomes in older adults with cancer, covering
innovative models, approaches and results in cancer
treatment and the impact of supportive services.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Cancers is an international online journal addressing
both clinical and basic science issues related to cancer
research. The journal is publishing in Open Access
format, which will certainly evolve to ensure that the
journal takes full advantage of the rapidly changing
world of information and knowledge dissemination. It
publishes high-quality clinical, translational, and basic
science research on cancer prevention, initiation,
progression, and treatment, as well as other related
topics, particularly to capture the most seminal studies
in the rapidly growing area of immunology,
immunotherapy, and tumor microenvironment.
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