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This collection is the second edition of the previous one,
entitled "Advances in Chronic Lymphocytic Leukemia
Microenvironment: The Disruption of the Supportive
Leukemic/Accessory Cells Interactions to Improve
Therapy Response"
(https://www.mdpi.com/journal/cancers/special_issues/
163TN7M343). It has become increasingly clear that the
stimuli derived from the cross-talk between the
neoplastic cells and the microenvironment have a
critical role in Chronic Lymphocytic leukemia (CLL)-
pathogenesis. We still need to better understand cell-
intrinsic and -extrinsic causes of therapy failure, further
taking into account the opportunities for using
combined therapies. Today, the exploration of CLL–
tumor–microenvironment (TME) interactions using
innovative 3D models, mimicking more reliable and
physiological neoplastic/accessory cells in in vivo
settings, will further shed new light and be of interest to
both research and clinical purposes. This Special Issue
encompasses new research articles and reviews that
advance our knowledge of CLL–TME cross-talk and that
highlight novel treatments optimized to reshape the
protumor microenvironment and potentiate current
therapies.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Cancers is an international online journal addressing
both clinical and basic science issues related to cancer
research. The journal is publishing in Open Access
format, which will certainly evolve to ensure that the
journal takes full advantage of the rapidly changing
world of information and knowledge dissemination. It
publishes high-quality clinical, translational, and basic
science research on cancer prevention, initiation,
progression, and treatment, as well as other related
topics, particularly to capture the most seminal studies
in the rapidly growing area of immunology,
immunotherapy, and tumor microenvironment.
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