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Message from the Guest Editor
One in two people lose the sense of touch after stroke. If
we are to address this problem using restorative
approaches to rehabilitation, we need to advance our
understanding of the neuroscience of touch and how we
might help stroke survivors regain a sense of touch
using approaches founded on neuroplasticity and
learning. The aim of this special issue is to advance the
neuroscience of touch and recovery of somatosensation
after stroke. We welcome submissions from pre-clinical
and applied fields of research to identify and synthesise
core knowledge and approaches to advance the field.
Reviews and original research papers on processing of
somatosensory information; neuroimaging of touch and
somatosensation; neuroplasticity of touch; perceptual
learning; impairment of touch, proprioceptive and haptic
object recognition after stroke; recovery of
somatosensation after stroke; and restorative
approaches to rehabilitation are encouraged. Clinical
studies and studies that employ neuroimaging,
magnetoencephalography and artificial intelligence, to
achieve new insights are suited to this Special Issue. 
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
You are invited to contribute a research article or a
comprehensive review for consideration and publication
in Brain Sciences (ISSN 2076-3425). Brain Sciences is
an open access, peer-reviewed scientific journal that
publishes original articles, critical reviews, research
notes, and short communications on neuroscience. The
scientific community and the general public can access
the content free of charge as soon as it is published.
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High Visibility:
indexed within Scopus, SCIE (Web of Science), PubMed,
PMC, Embase, PSYNDEX, PsycInfo, CAPlus / SciFinder,
and other databases.

Rapid Publication:
manuscripts are peer-reviewed and a first decision is
provided to authors approximately 16.2 days after
submission; acceptance to publication is undertaken in 1.9
days (median values for papers published in this journal in
the first half of 2025).

Recognition of Reviewers:
reviewers who provide timely, thorough peer-review
reports receive vouchers entitling them to a discount on
the APC of their next publication in any MDPI journal, in
appreciation of the work done.
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