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Message from the Guest Editors

Dear Colleagues,

This issue will be devoted to more recent aspects of
adipocyte biology, including the impact of sleep and
exercise that are now known to regulate adipose tissue
function and contribute to systemic metabolic function.
The title “new players” also refers to the authors of the
manuscripts. We have largely selected Assistant Professors
who are just establishing their own laboratories a0er
training in nationally recognized adipocyte biology
laboratories. Given the global epidemic of obesity, there is
increasing interest in adipocyte biology. Hence, we think
these manuscripts will be of great interest to investigators
in the fields of obesity, type 2 diabetes, and metabolic
diseases.
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Message from the Editorial Board

A major strength of biological science is the diversity of
approaches that biological scientists apply to their
research problems. Biology reflects this diversity and brings
together studies employing the varied experimental and
theoretical approaches that are fueling biological
discovery. Biology, the journal, is a fully peer-reviewed
publication with a rapid and economical route to open
access publication and is listed on PubMed. All articles are
peer-reviewed and the editorial focus is on determining
that the work is scientifically sound rather than trying to
predict its future impact.
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