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This Special Issue of Biologics will cover new research in
the area of antimicrobial peptides as biologics. The
focus of this issue will be on the interactions of
antimicrobial peptides with host cells and the
mechanism of their multiple biological functions, as well
as the methods for their characterization. Additionally,
research on clinical and pre-clinical experiments
involved in the application of antimicrobial peptides in
human medicine and on animal models is warmly
welcome. We particularly welcome original research
papers and reviews on the potential use or clinical
application of antimicrobial peptides in biomedical
sciences. Manuscripts are due on 31 December 2022,
but earlier submissions are welcome, and they will be
processed upon receipt and published online upon
acceptance.
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Biologics (ISSN 2673-8449) is an international,
multidisciplinary, peerreviewed, and scientific open
access, open source journal that encourages authors to
submit high-quality original research papers, reviews,
and communications in all areas of biologics derived
from both novel and established biotechnologies. We
invite you to contribute original researches, review
articles, essays or short reports for consideration and
publication in the journal. Rapid turnaround time and full
open access offer the opportunity to make research
results immediately available to scientific communities
and the general public.
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