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There is a growing interest on battery manufacturing
processes as more and more battery (giga)factories are
to be built all over the world in the near future. Such a
high battery manufacturing portfolio will definitely pave
the way for electrification of future. A reliable, low-cost,
best performant and secured value chain are envisioned
in the battery manufacturing processes towards 2040
and beyond.

In this Special Issue, we are looking for contributions
addressing the challenges with a particular focus on cell
assembly & manufacturing methodologies with a
chemistry-neutral approach. Latest advances on battery
materials allowing to boost large-scale battery
performance, scale-up cell manufacturing, smart
manufacturing methodologies and/or novel battery
machineries in lithium and post lithium systems are
highly encouraged. Industry 4.0 tools during cell
manufacturing such as 3D printing are also highly
welcome.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Take the opportunity to publish your original scientific
work or a review paper concerning battery materials,
battery technology or battery application within this new
open access journal. Along with material science, the
journal also addresses engineering and multidisciplinary
research topics, such as cell and system design or
storage system integration. Publishing proffers visibility
for the benefit of other experts and facilitates discussion
of the research results within the field. You are invited to
publish your work, read published papers and to
participate in topical discussions.
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