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Message from the Guest Editors

Dear Colleagues,

With the recent awareness of climate change and its
associated issues, electrochemical energy storage systems
(secondary batteries and super- or pseudocapacitors) are
important and established technologies which have
attracted significant interest from scientists and industries,
owing to their excellent performance in various fields (e.g.,
portable electronics, electro-mobility, renewable energies).
In all of these devices, carbon-based materials play a
fundamental role as active materials, conductive agents,
supporting scaffolds, etc.

For this Special Issue, we are seeking contributions that
improve the knowledge related to the use of carbon-based
materials in electrochemical energy storage systems, both
in their conventional uses and in more innovative and
unexplored ones.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

Take the opportunity to publish your original scientific
work or a review paper concerning battery materials,
battery technology or battery application within this new
open access journal. Along with material science, the
journal also addresses engineering and multidisciplinary
research topics, such as cell and system design or storage
system integration. Publishing proffers visibility for the
benefit of other experts and facilitates discussion of the
research results within the field. You are invited to publish
your work, read published papers and to participate in
topical discussions.
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