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Message from the Guest Editors
We are suffering the adverse health impacts caused by
air pollution, worsening heat exposure, heat waves, etc.
Though great efforts have been undertaken, the climate
and air pollution issues are still severe in the Asia-
Pacific, residents facing an increasing disease burden,
including higher risks of infectious diseases, non-
communicable diseases and accidents. This Special
Issue aims to present original research articles and
reviews in order to provide new findings with regard to
health impacts of climate change and air pollution in the
Asia-Pacific, topics of interest for the Special Issue
including, but not limited to: (1) air pollution and
infectious diseases; (2) air pollution and non-
communicable diseases; (3) air pollution and injuries; (4)
heat exposure, heatwaves, cold spells and human
health; (5) air pollution, heat exposure and occupational
health; (6) accurate exposure assessments, new study
designs and statistical methods; (7) public health
interventions addressing air pollution and abnormal
temperatures. 
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Continued developments in instrumentation and
modeling have driven atmospheric science to become
increasingly more complex with a deeper understanding
of concepts, mechanisms, and interactions. This is the
field that innovation built and it has led to a better
appreciation for the complexity with atmosphere.
Human life is intertwined in this complexity as we strive
to better understand our atmosphere. Climate change is
constantly stretching the limits of our thinking and
forcing new ideas and concepts to be played out.
Welcome to the Anthropocene!
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