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The International Conference on Advanced Materials,
Structures and Mechanical Engineering (ICAMSME
2022) will take place at Incheon National University,
Incheon, South-Korea, March 18-20, 2022. The
ICAMSME is an annual conference aimed at presenting
the current research being carried out in the fields of
materials, structures, and mechanical engineering. The
idea of the conference is for scientists, scholars,
engineers, and students from universities, research
institutes, and industries all around the world to present
their ongoing research activities. 

Special Issue papers can only be accepted through
conference paper submission. It is envisaged that this
conference will allow for the free exchange of ideas and
challenges among participants and encourage future
collaboration between members of these groups. The
conference will also foster cooperation among
organizations and researchers involved in the merging
fields and provide in-depth technical presentations with
abundant opportunities for individual discussions with
the presenters.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
As the world of science becomes ever more specialized,
researchers may lose themselves in the deep forest of
the ever increasing number of subfields being created.
This open access journal Applied Sciences has been
started to link these subfields, so researchers can cut
through the forest and see the surrounding, or quite
distant fields and subfields to help develop his/her own
research even further with the aid of this multi-
dimensional network.
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