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Orthodontics is a dental science that is continuously
evolving. Digital treatment planning, clear aligners, AI,
and 3D evaluation during the diagnostic process
constitute only a few of the topics that have been
growing quickly in recent years. Remaining updated
about progress in orthodontics is essential in being well
educated about diagnostic methods and treatment
options. Indeed, I think that it is important to publish
research papers that are useful for explaining news on
studies, data, and results to colleagues in the field.
Furthermore, I am very pleased to introduce this Special
Issue “Advanced Studies in Orthodontics”: it represents
a great opportunity to expand knowledge, results, and
new concepts about orthodontic clinical practice and
basic research. Feel free to send your research papers
to the Special Issue. It is as a special professional
opportunity!
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
As the world of science becomes ever more specialized,
researchers may lose themselves in the deep forest of
the ever increasing number of subfields being created.
This open access journal Applied Sciences has been
started to link these subfields, so researchers can cut
through the forest and see the surrounding, or quite
distant fields and subfields to help develop his/her own
research even further with the aid of this multi-
dimensional network.
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