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Message from the Guest Editors
As an important optical dispersion element, diffraction
grating is mainly used in spectrometers to realize the
dispersion of polychromatic light in its early application.
In recent years, with the development of science and
technology, the utility of grating has expanded, no
longer being not limited to spectral analysis. Its other
optical properties, such as beam splitting, polarization,
phase matching, etc., have attracted the attention of
scholars. The participation of leading scientists in this
field is crucial to guiding society and new users of this
technology towards a world transformed by diffraction
grating. The scope of this issue covers the
manufacturing technology of diffraction grating and its
important applications in spectral analysis, optical
holography, precision measurement, quantum optics,
optical communication, information processing, laser
energy modulation and other fields. We welcome
submissions exploring cutting-edge research and
recent advances in the fields of the diffraction grating
and its application fields. Both theoretical and
experimental studies are welcome, as well as
comprehensive reviews and survey papers.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
As the world of science becomes ever more specialized,
researchers may lose themselves in the deep forest of
the ever increasing number of subfields being created.
This open access journal Applied Sciences has been
started to link these subfields, so researchers can cut
through the forest and see the surrounding, or quite
distant fields and subfields to help develop his/her own
research even further with the aid of this multi-
dimensional network.
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