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Message from the Guest Editors
  Diamond-like coatings (DLC) have attracted an
enormous amount of interest in recent years, and for
good reason. We are able to change their properties by,
e.g., doping with various elements, among these Si, Ag,
and F deciding on their completely new properties. We
can produce DLC on many different surfaces, from
metallic to polymeric, both on a nano and microscale as
well as on large, complex surfaces. We discover their
new applications or expand their current ones,
especially in medicine or electronics. The purpose of
this Special Issue is to show the current trends in taking
advantage of DLC coatings. Articles showing
possibilities of surface modification with DLC or
modification of DLC coatings, especially the change of
surface properties under the influence of described
coatings for innovative applications will be appreciated.
In addition, thanks to these contributions, it will be
possible to show the directions of development of
today’s research in this field.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
As the world of science becomes ever more specialized,
researchers may lose themselves in the deep forest of
the ever increasing number of subfields being created.
This open access journal Applied Sciences has been
started to link these subfields, so researchers can cut
through the forest and see the surrounding, or quite
distant fields and subfields to help develop his/her own
research even further with the aid of this multi-
dimensional network.
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