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The existence of smart cities requires a new
organization structure that takes into account every
aspect of how a city runs. Smart cities work under a
more resource-efficient management and economy
than ordinary cities. As such, advanced business
models have emerged around smart cities, which lead
to the creation of smart enterprises or organizations that
depend on advanced software and computer
applications. Smart cities and smart enterprises deal
with the integration of artificial intelligence, web
technologies, smart mobile platforms,
telecommunications, e-commerce, e-business, and
other technologies. Fields of applications are related to
services for users and citizens, such as transportation,
buildings, e-health, utilities, etc. Prof. Eng. Donato
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
As the world of science becomes ever more specialized,
researchers may lose themselves in the deep forest of
the ever increasing number of subfields being created.
This open access journal Applied Sciences has been
started to link these subfields, so researchers can cut
through the forest and see the surrounding, or quite
distant fields and subfields to help develop his/her own
research even further with the aid of this multi-
dimensional network.
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